
 

GENERAL ASSEMBLY OF NORTH CAROLINA 
 

SESSION 1995 
 
H 1  
 

HOUSE BILL 526 
 
 
 
 
Short Title:  Greensboro Bid Limits Increased. (Local) 
 
───────────────────────────────────────  
Sponsors: Representatives Cocklereece; Adams, Bowie, Boyd-McIntyre, Culp, Decker, 
Sharpe, and Wood. 
 
───────────────────────────────────────  
Referred to:  Local and Regional Government II. 
 
───────────────────────────────────────  
 

March 22, 1995 
 

A BILL TO BE ENTITLED 1 
AN ACT TO INCREASE THE INFORMAL BID LIMITS RELATING TO THE 2 

LETTING OF PURCHASE CONTRACTS BY THE CITY OF GREENSBORO. 3 
The General Assembly of North Carolina enacts: 4 

Section 1.  Section 2 of Chapter 53 of the 1987 Session Laws reads as 5 
rewritten: 6 

"Sec. 2.  G.S. 143-129 is further amended by deleting 'ten thousand dollars ($10,000)', 7 
and substituting 'thirty thousand dollars ($30,000)' 'fifty thousand dollars ($50,000)'." 8 

Sec. 2.  Section 3 of Chapter 53 of the 1987 Session Laws reads as rewritten: 9 
"Sec. 3.  G.S. 143-131 is amended by deleting 'two thousand five hundred dollars 10 

($2,500)', and substituting 'ten thousand dollars ($10,000)' 'twenty thousand dollars 11 
($20,000)'." 12 

Sec. 3.  This act is effective upon ratification. 13 


