
 

NORTH CAROLINA GENERAL ASSEMBLY 

1973 SESSION 

 

 

CHAPTER 26 

HOUSE BILL 224 

 

AN ACT TO AMEND CHAPTER 504, SESSION LAWS OF 1961, THE CHARTER 

OF THE TOWN OF DALLAS, AS IT RELATES TO PUBLIC CONTRACTS. 

 

The General Assembly of North Carolina enacts: 

 

Section 1.  Section 16 of Chapter 504, Session Laws of 1961, is amended by 

deleting the words and figures "one thousand dollars ($1,000)", and inserting in lieu 

thereof the words and figures "two thousand five hundred dollars ($2,500)". 

Sec. 2. Section 17 of Chapter 504, Session Laws of 1961 is amended by 

deleting the words and figures "one thousand dollars ($1,000)", and inserting in lieu 

thereof the words and figures "five thousand dollars ($5,000)". 

Sec. 3. This act is effective upon ratification. 

In the General Assembly read three times and ratified, this the 22nd day of 

February, 1973. 


